
Town of Ridgefield  Diesel & Gasoline, Bid 12-15 <-----Current Bid prices --------------> <-----Prior year Bid prices -------------->

Delivery fr ~Sept 2011 to June 2012 Delivery fr ~July 2010 to June 2011

8/11/11 at 11am via invitation only / faxed or e-mailed price 08/11/11 08/11/11 02/11/10 02/11/10

 135K Gl Diesel 37.5K Gl 87 Oct 160 K Gl Diesel 60K Gl 87 Oct

Company Name Contact Phone Fax Price p/Gl Price p/Gl Price p/Gl Price p/Gl

Standard Oil Bill Prince 203-334-5532x3002 203-337-3529 3.0900$                  2.8400$              2.315 2.255

Buckley Oil Lex Johnson 203-336-3541 x 1334 203-367-2412 3.0836$                  2.7352$              No Bid No Bid

East River Don Herzog 203-453-1200 203-453-3899 3.0654$                  2.7997$              2.6198 2.4905

mary Ann/Collen 203-453-1200 x2015

Sprague Energy Burr Mosher 914-328-6726 914-328-6721 No response No response 2.4385 No Bid

Jennete Roister 914-328-6700 x 30 914-328-6711

Mitchell Oil Mike Moffa 203-744-0600 203-743-7978 3.1380$                  3.1662$              No Bid No Bid

Dime Oil Thomas Kraft 203-754-5334 203-754-0790 2.9968$                  2.7831$              No Bid No Bid

Laurie / Jackie

Branchville Oil Paul Civerelli 544-8460 544-0060 No Bid No Bid

Boxed prices awarded bid for that product *

Jerry Gay, C.P.P.B. Purchasing Director

Town of Ridgefield


