
Town of Ridgefield & Community Center for total of 57,000gl  #2 Oil  

8/11/11 at 11am via fax/email, Bid 12-14 for 2011 / 2012 season 2/28/2010 2/28/2010

BOE price Town Price  

8/11/11, 11am Tanks 6K+ gl Tanks >6K gl

Company Name Contact Phone Fax 57,000 Gal 160,000 gl 75,000 gl

Branchville Oil Paul Civerelli 544-8460 544-0060 3.0970$           2.3440$               2.3940$                 

375,040$             179,550$               

 554,590$               

Mitchell Oil Mike Moffa 203-744-0600 203-743-7978 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Standard Oil Bill Prince 203-334-5532x3002 203-337-3535 3.1000$           2.2050$               2.2900$           

352,800$             171,750$               

524,550$               

Buckley Oil Lex Johnson 800-739-1852 x1334 203-367-2412 3.0405$           2.2658$               2.3021$                 

362,528$             172,658$               

535,186$               

East River Mary Ann 203-453-1200 x2030 203-453-3899 3.1006$           2.3118$               2.3714$                 

New Haven Don Herzog 369,888$             177,855$               

547,743$               

Hoffman Oil Joe Yaworowski 203-396-5579 203-373-5994 3.2600$           No Bid No Bid

Casey Fuel Bay Lobb 438-6500 431-8004 3.3990$           2.4490$               2.4900$                 

391,840$             186,750$               

578,590$               

Montanari Fuel Andy 438-2688 438-3869 No Response No Bid No Bid

Dime Oil Thomas Kraft 203-754-5334 203-754-0790 No Bid N/A N/A

Waterbury

Jerry Gay, C.P.P.B. Purchasing Director

Town of Ridgefield


